
MADHAT Version 1.1.1 

END USER LICENSE AGREEMENT 

This End-User License Agreement (this “EULA”) is a legal agreement between you 
(“Licensee”) and Dan Romik (“Licensor”), the author of the MadHat Version 1.1.1 
software application and associated data files (the “Software”), the deliverables 
provided pursuant to this EULA.

By downloading, installing, copying, or otherwise using the Software, Licensee agrees 
to be bound by the terms and conditions set forth in this EULA. If Licensee does not 
agree to the terms and conditions set forth in this EULA, then Licensee may not 
download, install, or use the Software.

1. Grant of license

A) Scope of license. Subject to the terms of this EULA, Licensor hereby grants to 
Licensee a royalty-free, non-exclusive, perpetual license to download, possess 
and use a copy of the Software.

B) Reproduction and Distribution. Licensee may reproduce an unlimited number 
of copies of the Software for Licensee’s use, provided each copy shall be a true 
and complete copy, including all intellectual property notices, and shall be 
accompanied by a copy of this EULA. Licensee is not allowed to distribute the 
Software to third parties.

2. Title to Software. Licensor represents and warrants that it has the legal right to 
enter into and perform its obligations under this EULA, and that use by the Licensee 
of the Software, in accordance with the terms of this EULA, will not infringe upon the 
intellectual property rights of any third parties.

3. Intellectual Property. All now known or hereafter known tangible and intangible 
rights, title, interest, copyrights and moral rights in and to the Software, including but 
not limited to all images, photographs, animations, video, audio, music, text, data, 
computer code, algorithms, and information, are owned by Licensor. The Software is 
protected by all applicable copyright laws and international treaties. 

4. Support. Licensor has no obligation to provide support services for the Software, 
but may do so at its discretion.

5. Jurisdiction. This EULA shall be deemed to have been made in, and shall be 
construed pursuant to the laws of the State of California without regard to conflicts of 
laws provisions thereof. This EULA is made within the exclusive jurisdiction of the 
United States, and its jurisdiction shall supersede any other jurisdiction of either 
party’s election. 



6. Severability.  No failure to exercise, and no delay in exercising, on the part of either 
party, any privilege, any power or any rights hereunder will operate as a waiver 
thereof, nor will any single or partial exercise of any right or power hereunder 
preclude further exercise of any other right hereunder. If any provision of this EULA 
shall be adjudged by any court of competent jurisdiction to be unenforceable or 
invalid, that provision shall be limited or eliminated to the minimum extent necessary 
so that this EULA shall otherwise remain in full force and effect and enforceable

7. WARRANTY DISCLAIMER. LICENSOR, AND AUTHOR OF THE SOFTWARE, 
HEREBY EXPRESSLY DISCLAIM ANY WARRANTY FOR THE SOFTWARE. THE 
SOFTWARE AND ANY RELATED DOCUMENTATION IS PROVIDED “AS IS” 
WITHOUT WARRANTY OF ANY KIND, EITHER EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, 
INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION, THE IMPLIED WARRANTIES OF 
MERCHANTABILITY, FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE, OR NON-
INFRINGEMENT. LICENSEE ACCEPTS ANY AND ALL RISK ARISING OUT OF 
USE OR PERFORMANCE OF THE SOFTWARE.

8. LIMITATION OF LIABILITY. LICENSOR SHALL NOT BE LIABLE TO LICENSEE, 
OR ANY OTHER PERSON OR ENTITY CLAIMING THROUGH LICENSEE ANY 
LOSS OF PROFITS, INCOME, SAVINGS, OR ANY OTHER CONSEQUENTIAL, 
INCIDENTAL, SPECIAL, PUNITIVE, DIRECT OR INDIRECT DAMAGE, WHETHER 
ARISING IN CONTRACT, TORT, WARRANTY, OR OTHERWISE. THESE 
LIMITATIONS SHALL APPLY REGARDLESS OF THE ESSENTIAL PURPOSE OF 
ANY LIMITED REMEDY. UNDER NO CIRCUMSTANCES SHALL LICENSOR’S 
AGGREGATE LIABILITY TO LICENSEE, OR ANY OTHER PERSON OR ENTITY 
CLAIMING THROUGH LICENSEE, EXCEED THE FINANCIAL AMOUNT 
ACTUALLY PAID BY LICENSEE TO LICENSOR FOR THE SOFTWARE.

9. Entire Agreement. This EULA constitutes the entire agreement between Licensor 
and Licensee and supersedes all prior understandings of Licensor and Licensee, 
including any prior representation, statement, condition, or warranty with respect to 
the subject matter of this EULA. 

 

For additional information regarding this EULA, please contact:

Dan Romik 
Email: hatter@madhat.design


